
ROSC Training

1. ROSC Training (Sections 394.453(1)(c), 394.4573, 394.9082 F.S; LSFHS Incorporated Document 36, DCF Guidance
Document 35) Is there evidence of New Employee Orientation and staff training on Florida's Recovery Oriented System of
Care (ROSC) using Recovery Management 1-7 modules developed by the Florida Certification Board? (Training modules
can be found and downloaded at www.lsfhealthsystems.org/rosc)

2. ROSC Training (Sections 394.453(1)(c), 394.4573, 394.9082 F.S; LSFHS Incorporated Document 36) Has the
employee attested to completing Recovery Management Module 1? (acceptable proof would be HR attestation in
personnel file; sign-in sheet; anything that is documented to indicate staff member reviewed the module.)

3. ROSC Training (Sections 394.453(1)(c), 394.4573, 394.9082 F.S; LSFHS Incorporated Document 36) Has the
employee completed Recovery Management Module 2? (use this for subsequent years; mark N/A the first year)

4. ROSC Training (Sections 394.453(1)(c), 394.4573, 394.9082 F.S; LSFHS Incorporated Document 36) Has the
employee completed Recovery Management Training Module 3? (mark n/a the first year; audit Module 1 for every
employee sampled;  audit modules 2-7 for refresher trainings for each long-term employee. Tip: audit for 2 modules a
year over 3 years)

5. ROSC Training (Sections 394.453(1)(c), 394.4573, 394.9082 F.S; LSFHS Incorporated Document 36) Has the
employee completed Recovery Management Module 4? (mark n/a the first year; audit Module 1 for every employee
sampled;  audit modules 2-7 for refresher trainings for each long-term employee. Tip: audit for 2 modules a year over 3
years)

6. ROSC Training (Sections 394.453(1)(c), 394.4573, 394.9082 F.S; LSFHS Incorporated Document 36) Has the
employee completed Recovery Management Module 5? (mark n/a the first year; audit Module 1 for every employee
sampled;  audit modules 2-7 for refresher trainings for each long-term employee. Tip: audit for 2 modules a year over 3
years)

7. ROSC Training (Sections 394.453(1)(c), 394.4573, 394.9082 F.S; LSFHS Incorporated Document 36) Has the
employee completed Recovery Management Module 6? (mark n/a the first year; audit Module 1 for every employee
sampled;  audit modules 2-7 for refresher trainings for each long-term employee. Tip: audit for 2 modules a year over 3
years)

8. ROSC Training (Sections 394.453(1)(c), 394.4573, 394.9082 F.S; LSFHS Incorporated Document 36) Has the
employee completed Recovery Management Module 7? (mark n/a the first year; audit Module 1 for every employee
sampled;  audit modules 2-7 for refresher trainings for each long-term employee. Tip: audit for 2 modules a year over 3
years)
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